
 
 
 

 
Primary Calendar 25/26 

September   

 

Sunday Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday Saturday 

 1 2 3 4 5 6 

 Merdeka Day 
Replacement Term Starts 

Coffee Morning: 
TISA Academy 

(Archery) 

Parent Information 
Evening 

Prophet 
Muhammad’s 

Birthday 
 

7 8 9 10 11 12 13 

 ECAs/Tuition 
Start  

Coffee Morning: 
Welcome from 

Leadership 
 Malaysia Day 

parade   

14 15 16 17 18 19 20 

 Additional 
Public Holiday Malaysia Day     

21 22 23 24 25 26 27 

   
Coffee Morning: 

iPad Use in 
Primary 

   

28 29 30th     

       

 

Holidays (No School) Parent Invited Event School Event Sports Fixture/Trip Assessments 

 
Parent Information Evening ECA and Tuition Begin Malaysia Day Coffee Mornings 

Parents and carers are invited to 
the school and into classrooms to 
meet the new teachers, as well as 
hear presentations about the new 
school year and, more specifically, 

the term ahead. Parents and 
carers will be provided with 

information about the curriculum 
for particular year groups, as well 

as key dates for Term 1. The 
sessions will be at 3:30pm and are 

held in classrooms. 

Teachers will post their class lists 
of ECAs on Class Dojo before 
they are due to start. If you are 

unsure of your child’s ECAs for the 
week, please check Class Dojo or 
get in touch with the office or your 

child’s teacher.  
Parents will be contacted directly 
if their child is invited for tuition.  

The school will be celebrating 
Malaysia Day by having a 

parade through the school 
during the school day. Lesson 
activities will also celebrate the 

national holiday. 
Pictures and videos of the 

parade will be shared on Class 
Dojo. 

We’re excited to kick off the term 
with three informative coffee 
mornings. In Week 1, TISA 

Academy will showcase their 
archery activities and answer any 
questions. In Week 2, join us for a 
warm welcome back from school 
leadership. Then in Week 4, we’ll 
explore iPad use in Primary and 

how you can support digital 
learning at home. We look 

forward to seeing you there! 

 
If you have any questions regarding the Primary School, please contact Ms Charlotte at 

 : charlotte.r@eaton.edu.my ​ : 03-8741 4965 
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